
FEBRUARY 20, 2018 - REGULAR MEETING - #08

VOLUME 21

MEETING

The Ross County Board of Commissioners met on this day, February 20, 2018, in regular session.

Mr. R. Douglas Corcoran, President, called the meeting to order at 9: 00 a.m., with Commissioners Stephen A. Neal and Dwight A.

Garrett also in attendance.

MINUTES APPROVED

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that the minutes of the previous meeting of the Ross County Board of Commissioners, of
February 12, 2018, be approved as submitted.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

BILLS APPROVED FOR PAYMENT

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the following bills of the county be approved for payment:

5 010

V I II I fl( Ifl( Ifl(   II II V1 LII l

iuiuiuiuiuiuiliuiu IViu lUiuiuiu iuiuiluiuiuiu iNuiui iuiuiuiuiuiul Viu uuiu uiu    iuiuiuiiuiuiuiu•    iuiuiuiUU uiuiUl iuiui iuiuiuiuiiuiuiu iu iuiu uiuiu 6iuiuiuiuiuiUiuiu

1 . 2`1 2011 20190Q07,6 1 21 2015 Accuiate HeatMg & Coding 146. 00

2.2  -1 L)  220 19 0    ,
7

1 222 2C)1̀9 Ace Truck Body-. 1n  ..    21 " " .

1 20 :2 0 1 2 10 1 S 00 0 5S' 1  . L)  20 1 S Advazice AutioPrt;s 2"-.  4

131 013 201 00014178 1 1 2019 Ahgas Great Lakes 5 9

12°°  1.  2t 1       °' 1   " .     12 1.   201       . SPC AFC, hi  . 30  0

1:       It S5 F

1  ":"' 1;9 201 000 1   , 01 "  Rai o 1 k

01 S0001316
21

1 . 1 °' 21) 1 S      - 20 18000126
21

14 2,0 18 Devin  . Wv alter A

1 2:2•°2 01 013ID 0 0 1271 1  ' 131 2 01'S A.     110. 0 0

1 2  °11 tt   12 2 . I . I : 21 1r          1:  ttl 122 "   

1 1)' 001'3 6 0 B Mlle-

1 2' 4 ' 1 1' 10 1 S&  0 1       1 2. 4 ` 2,01 S IC shit a 1011C C Oil a1

12 -I 2ois,      2L) 190 1`       1 14 201S Ca,1 : t 1 hie C nvia.,  1

1 . 21 X01' 01 ti ( 0  ('11 12()1.     1) IV ar ovt., liar-  2S '

1 °   1 2 1 2 8 0O 016 " 1 1 21 2 1 S CDVkFGovAllnllent, hu"

1 1 2 01 X000211 1  : 31 201  " D-- V̀

1 21 .2CB1 t,       2,018 0 0 0 6 1 21 201&       tr.''  nual (' emtc:  H;ar&-,,-are

2  18 I) 00 2  ,  2,  1 1 1 t 1 1,         1 t A 3

2 01 21) 1 0 0 0 '11 1 201 611 th Fn-e & S.e cwt 6 5.

1 31 01 2 1. 1 S 1:) 11011 aJ1 1  : x ' 1. 211 1 Si       . k me e n hulfiat„

1  .  1 2 0 1'      2'Q 1    C, 0+1'  1 21 21.11° Cult a.: C rpo rat.l l    J3 0 hs

10 `111.  2 01 2 9 7 64 1 21 20 L6 ColialibusEul,      O t t t 2, 1. 00.0

1t -  2•'u 11     •1 E.     itt 93

14 2 C 1 S 21 1 19 0 C,
05

4`
7

y 14 2 0 IS C ohunbu s 1 mott tiv.-  s t 119000

1 21 201 2018:00 00` 1 1 . 331 2 01Cttilll. Ketu .  t L 1" 0."

1  ' 2 2() 1. 21) I 's 0 0 r 1' . 1  ,"!  2 01 C omill.. Treiva 1 4. 5 0



11) 1 4D C) 0 2112 utn I' t, Jam le  K 0E

1 701 2)01 t a l a 1    °  ;  I . E._ H 1 t t_ ItY. 171( 11

jo

I 1 701S 11    :  1 D. E. Hu    .1 t"eta. Inc.       44 `. L) O

VS IuI uu
lIui

uuui uNa
uu IVunn ll uuu i uliiuiluiuiuiul Vuu

iuuVil
uA

l Iiin       . Inc,1 l 2 OI X01H0C,   :7 1 2 G'  01- a Iavt      x

ii u

u uulilO11u11Iiii'll 110tll1 MOMMOMMKINMEMMOMM

uui
11111u

Iu
ffl. l

20 1 0 C)    201S Dept. of VeteransAffalxs'

uu luuuuuuluuu U

1  . 31  - 20, 13 0130Ol0 1 S'       1 3. 1 ' 2019 I TE I 1 Ott""butOlt  , Inc. 45.
31

C

I rJ X013 10 19 10".1 1 , 30 20,19 Eastbav Itis

20I S X 01 S 42"1 D1 FIecn   . d

e 1M

1 11 2015      -10 150004 S12 1 1 1S F  tet"t 1 C mpi'my

1 6 2019 21018000114 1 6  "' 0 18 First C! L 7

1   201&      201     0̀0 133-6 21,  1   ". 01"9 Fletnima Angeta Himch I   .

1 2 0 10 181QQ0I 8 1 2JIS Ft Ix Inclowner Corprate 61 .

JA 201 S.       10 12 0 0 D 136 14 X01 R Gadsmn, JOrmetta D. 602. L:



1 AVM 01S0 0030 11 120B Lexis axis 165507

2: 13 ' 2018X01 000596 T 13 201.  Laida  ' Qat 13, 44

IS 1 018 201 S000782 HAM Litter uahty PrQpane Gas 977. 94

F31 `201 01 S 0001e73 111 "2018 Littei Quaht.y P' 0Fa—'e Gas g

2012018       '2 0 1 H 001 S 20001S01S Lit.tei Quahty acpane Gras J, 0,46. 6,9

1111.0018 2013000 w       N V2018 Lowes 100. 6

1 1 2018 01SUN758 1 VMS Loses 595. 05

1 160018 X01 H007 S 1 = 10201S Lykina Chl Curipany 515. 80

I Is 1111011
p NiP

UPI I
iulu iuiui

u00
u u luunn lUiu iuiui luiui a iuiui iuuiuilulilu uluiuum iui iuiuiui I uiuiuiu iuiuiuiuiuiuiuiuiul6iuiui uuiui uiui iuiuiuiu"tliuiuiuinld' iuiuiululViuiui

iuiuiulll!
lil!l! l'  

U!  U IIP u u 1 i ui lsuiuiu uu

1 31 -201S 2018000791 1 31 2013 Fab.fication 1 3 1 AN"

2, 72018 018 00 0 58 7 2,     2018,  N l m & Flig   ' 1•w ort st  p 362. 03

1 ` 1 V2018 01 SUCI 76 1 1 201'   lain Shorns.tap 150. 00,

1 260018 X19 001 1 26" 2018 of Central 1&      8 54 74

1 31.    0IR 01 ROOD 4     - 111 -2018 ntral   * u M1 2. 24

1 3 02 01 S 10 18 0 Ca M00 1 11 2013 Media NIP-T' LvoF'Cnt r l (Rdo,    549A),

1 HAMS 01 S1) DO 667 l -26 ,2019 Nleh-  -tSuone Co.,   5, 707. 5s

111 20172012000196 12 , 1 2017 Nlild-0ho :  -ycllc)14c .1 ; S' len ice, 1llay.   i`00  )0

1 121201S 201SOOD159 1 06 ,2CIS06,2C1N o dolts Le! 1 '11 . ;°5

2 20188 0 1 S 0 0 CY42 2   ,  2,µ)1' S IM Cl dem Lea Angg 1 j•  4

21

9 0012 NANNY 0 1 0512 If 0 dem Lasaurb, 9 2 7

1 2018 201'  00195 2.  1 20111 1 o em, Le a cing 417, 27

2:  1 2018 21.711   ' 01) 02 04       ,
n

1  "
xa

a s ATM

9 2018 201SOMR32 NIIS No ru R d l y 73. 1

1 10018 20180003S4

1 2 018 2018000234 2A -2015 Office City Expres-s 5; x.11. 74u

2018"    0 1 ' S O1:. D 07 2 7 2018 Mice C i' y "Ex' a re-;    176, 78

2 9 A 1 fj 1 ` 0 0 N 216 2, 19 2 1 FI C e, Ci ,y F" y) r ss 206. 97

1 23 2018 201 S0001383 1 2 3 1 S Depot

2. u1' W 1 SOC"wliD764       ""  5  *.,  1'       t t   f la t 111c. 9

1 1 2018 Ca 19 fi°)7 3 1 1 2013 0thria,  Rp-inu l A.  7ciafiic,,,

2 1 AM D 1 O CI D P 3 2 12 018 Mo sT t LA i c y sl y



ge-1   11. 0 01800018L Chi Demand I

11 2' o1s 2,0 18 0 00 068      . 2.11  ,1 IS P:ajk,, Nlelv4i H. Jr.     D0 C) D

1 1 2 0 19 00 1C, 764 1 1 P 210 1 Penvveu, Sulia 0. 1  -

2 13 4019 10 18 0 0      -J-      21 13 X01.'9 Pike Cci, Recovery C''Cuncil 3-59.5

ns hinicipal huck Supph,1) 1' ,

2,  5 Fix,   Ien, i1c e 5 563. 061,11 21), 8000J,02      . 6.

C.I s 0 1 S 00 0 0776 1,  5 19 Pro 'Tire Sler,,icen-

ILI1012000190 Is Pre- Meen Industfial 3erviee D L) D I)

2  '11 mlS      -1 O' l Is 1) 0 Ol 3 7 2 11 1-,() 1 S Rank-I LI J.  E) 1)

Cl ry S1 1 lrj J 7 1 0 1 IS, Ream. Clifford E, Ir 121. I

Co, AVatet Compax),       1.,      91      - D IS

1 '

41. 
6 21: 0 17 2:0 1 - 7 1) C, 10 07"7 1 t6 2 0 17 Rios C,o tet Con-LIP anv

Tan,I V,11012 77 D 19 1) 0 10 93,       1 ls R os Co, Vat r Co 7 any

I 1 2,0 1 IS Rico s& C 0 D 0 DD14 2 0 2,       2 019 1) Cl 10 911 She tiff sI D iepT

2 Ol 2 0 Ci C, 71 16       ' 1 1 1, 1 IS Rush Tiuck. Calrit a rs :o If Ohi o Cl 0 C,0

1 , 4   .01s 2 o S 00 Q SID I 1 14,  0 1 s Rush Truck Centyrs Qf OljjL) 3- 3

1 9 1) 0 1      "::° i iI Rush 7tuck Centers of Ohin-   4 ip 6 7`014x'01;":'  1

1 2,191, 2 01'       . 2 Cl 19 C) 0 Cl 1D9 1 219  ;
111,

0 Is Schic-djamiela K-,       6100

1 2 6 2 0 1 S      - 701300C,  154 1 , 21,
15 , 201S Stioto 'shoe Nlaxt

1l I S,      2 1. 111s Q Cl,Ii-       I  - ) -, C11IS IIi Ito Shoe! Maxt 1- 14. 9s

1 2 2() 1 2 0 131) Cl C, ol 1 15  :':o"I's So uthe aatom *E quip inent., CQ 490. 64

1'S'» 2 of 13 0 Cl

L1,
1- 7 1154 1 1 ,- 1,o 18 Spialkle Clearlen, Cj

13 1) 0 C) 15,27,       1 : 1 ,* 0 1 s spaille Cleatlers 76, 0 C,

9 C,nit     "S2 0 1
1:

8 0 C, C)     1 6 - 2, 018 11 ` 6 pl,       FIC

1 0 2 Cl 3 01 S 0 ' C D 1 1 2-ols St,a ffa,itfs Lo ick.& Ke-v

2 Z i JI tate Elect-tile Inc.       24

AV 2,0 1&      2 C7, 19 0 0 0 6 D9 2 4  --1 CI I S ste c--rvii Inc. 12

2 L) 19 J.) 00 13 6 1  "Cils Terl-Alzit- Olakex. Latidis,  T
1631

C. D0

ie215 2011S      . 2.C) I IS C. 0 D 136 1 1 2 Terhw   - lDlakex, Latidi,,;  L.

1 7 4 2 0 1 2 0 I 's 0 C) 0 19.3 1  ` 4 2() 17 Thomas llunteT S.
81

0

I I ; 2, C.) 1'       l 's1) 0 0 3,9-5,       ill 1qionisii Reuters - West 6 0. 6 5

I I 1101-S, 2 D`) 1 s 0 0 0.;,
31

Cl I I r) 1" I'

ll
1 30 2ols 2018000091 1

31

1 OIs Tlovv Fath INlatel"lah,  5 12. 9 5,

I Dls I I Ss 0 Cj J I fI I Ol R I surer. St a e L) f Oliio 4 S;

20 19 OCs C) 114 S 0 1 S,  Tre a:suxer. Stat- o f 04io D6 Lo

9 2 C1,11 S 2 01 1) 0 011621       . 21, 
19 2 D 12 TAtifty S'ervilcles Group 5 9 9 3- 22

I I S  - 2 Ol S I Ol S 1) C',04 1' 1',       1 IQi  -` 0 IS UPS S9

11 Ol US, Safe-v Geat- 111C,     43 2



X01 S 01     "  4 01 11"-N, '-,' afet-v Geat.   Cll

1 0 19 201 01) 4 70       "  1 110 1'     elaxd  . Tin-to 1i ,  . A.     1. 9's

1 1 20"1. '      x+01 001 1 1 19 22013 1 S A 0, C)

1 19 01 B X01S-0 0 0 5 '*.       1 19: 2.01'   B.'A

018000 94 0 1S V. '     lGra"t° zer,jnic. 441. 1

1 29 ,21.)1 S 0180001 lD9 1 . L19  -2 O 1 kp̀lch. Davi fico to  ]       2.0C)

12,  2'q 2c) r 201 000113 12 `2 9  .    1       % V P x Ra Ilk 1 i112. 6p"

1 1 :

41(,
11 701 r)     1 1

1 1 ' 20I 701 S000c)23,       1 3 1 201 Is vVex Bad

y  -   1101y( 4̀7,       2` Ir òzl ° I'7xu1 uIp1yIng_ 1 '      .
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On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

THEN & NOW CERTIFICATES APPROVED

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve " Then & Now" Certificates, dated

February 12, 2018 through February 16, 2018, in the amount of $1, 675. 74 prepared by the Office of the Ross County Auditor and
certified by the auditor as to the appropriation of funds for the purpose of encumbering the sum of the contract( s) or order( s) outlined
therein, or the imminent collection of funds for credit to the appropriated fund( s) of the county, and as to the availability of funds for
transfer within the appropriate department( s).

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

APPROPRIATION APPLICATIONS APPROVED FOR MEETING ATTENDANCE - EMA

LITTER

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve applications ( 5) for appropriations as
indicated, submitted by the following employees of the Ross County Departments for meeting attendance listed:

EMA Paul Minney Southeast Sector Monthly, OCU Campus, February 20, 2018, at Circleville, OH   $ 0. 00 ( approx.)

2018 Vinton County full scale exercise, March 24, 2018, McArthur, OH 0. 00 ( approx.)

2018 OH Pipeline Safety Program, March 29, 2018, at Logan, OH 0. 00 ( approx.)

EMA-G386 Mass Fatalities Incident Response, October 10- 11, 2018,

At Jackson, OH 0. 00 ( approx.)

Litter Judi Mannion Outreach Specialist meeting for RPHF Solid Waste Dist. Feb. 22, 2018,
Washington Court House, OH 27.00

approx.)

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

ASSET DISPOSAL FORMS APPROVED - VARIOUS

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve an Asset Disposal Form submitted by
the Ross County Departments listed, for disposal of the following surplus personal property of the county as indicated:

QUANTITY DEPT.  DESCRIPTION METHOD OF

DISPOSAL

Two (2) Court 41 Tan filing cabinets, Tag 400216, 00350 Transfer to Surplus

Property
Three ( 3) Sheriff Systemax PC' s, Serial 4106486146, 106478533, 10657356

Ic Ic

Ic

One ( 1)      HP Printer, Serial 4USDB083484, Tag 406803
Ic Ic

Ic

Thirteen ( 13)       HP Laptops, Serial 4CN-OGD366- G62- 05MI, KRD3430R4V,

CNU7351JBL, CNU7351J98, CNU7351J94, CNU7351JBZ,

CNU7351J8N, CNU7351JB4, CNU7351JBD, CNU7351JBK,

CNU7351J9C, CNU7351JBR, KRD3430F70
Ic Ic

Ic

Nine (9) Auditor Monitors, Tag 415882, 15896, 12485, 15894, 15892, 15895, 15893,
15897, 15898

Ic Ic



On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

RESOLUTION ADOPTED - OHIO REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION

Mr. Garrett moved the adoption of the following resolution:

RESOLUTION NO. 18- 109

AUTHORIZING THE COMMISSIONERS TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT WITH OHIO REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT

CORPORATION FOR ADMINISTRATION SERVICES FOR 2018 COMMUNITY HOUSING IMPACT AND

PRESERVATION (CHIP) PROGRAM AND AUTHORIZING ORDC TO SUBMIT THE PY 2018 COMMUNITY HOUSING

IMPACT AND PRESERVATION ( CHIP) PROGRAM APPLICATION WITH THE STATE OF OHIO ON BEHALF OF

ROSS COUNTY

WHEREAS, the Ross County, in conjunction with the City of Chillicothe, is applying for PY 2018 Community Housing Impact and
Preservation Program  ( CHIP)  funding from the State of Ohio,  Development Services Agency,  Office of Community
Development( OCD) in the amount of$750,000 for the purpose of addressing local housing needs;

WHEREAS, Ohio Regional Development Corporation, the Consultant, is a consulting firm with experience in applying for and
administering CHIP Grant Programs throughout the State of Ohio, and was selected via the RFQ/P process to act as the consultant for
Ross County in applying for and administering the PY 2018 CHIP Program for Ross County;

WHEREAS, it is necessary for the Grantee and the Consultant to enter into an Agreement which sets forth the responsibilities and
expectations of each party for the PY 2018 CHIP Program;

WHEREAS, OCD Policy 15- 02, 2 CFR 200. 320, and the Partnership Agreement authorizes the Grantee to hire an administrative
consultant, on behalf of the partnership, and those services are detailed in this contract for administrative services;

WHEREAS, the City of Chillicothe will be the Partner and Ross County will be the Grantee of the Partnership, as per the Partnership
agreement, therefore, the Consultant will provide services that cover the Partner' s jurisdictions as well.

WHEREAS, Grantee and Consultant understand this agreement is contingent on PY 2016 CHIP funding from the State of Ohio,
Development Services Agency, Office of Community Development ( OCD);

WHEREAS, this agreement is in effect until the CHIP funds are expended and the funded activities are complete and closed out; now,

therefore, be it

RESOLVED, by the Board of Commissioners, Ross County, Ohio:

Section l:   That Ross County authorizes Ohio Regional Development Corporation, to file a PY-2018 Community Housing
Impact and Preservation ( CHIP) Program Application with the State of Ohio, Development Services Agency, and to provide all
information and documentation required in said Application submission.

Section 2:  That Ross County hereby approves the filing of said Application.

Section 3:  Ross County authorizes Ohio Regional Development Corporation to execute the HOME written agreement on their
behalf for the CHIP projects, or any other necessary documents for CHIP projects.

Section 4:  The Ross County Commissioners authorize the execution of an Agreement for the PY-2018 Community Housing
Impact and Preservation ( CHIP) Program for Administration and Implementation Services with the Ohio Regional Development

Corporation ( ORDC).  However, the agreement in only enforceable upon funding of the PY 2018 CHIP, therefore contingent upon
funding from the State of Ohio, Development Services Agency.  ORDC is to work with and at the direction of the Ross County in
order to assure that all services, information and documentation required by said Agreements, HUD, the State of Ohio and/or CHIP
guidelines are provided.

Mr. Neal seconded the motion and the result of the roll call vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion

carried.

Adopted this
20th

day of February, 2018.
Board of Commissioners of Ross County,
Ohio

R. Douglas Corcoran, President

Stephen A. Neal, Vice President

Dwight A. Garrett

END*****

CONTRACT ENTERED INTO - OHIO REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners, enter into a Contract for Administrative
Services, by and between Ohio Regional Development Corporation, for PY 2018 Community Housing Impact and Preservation
Program, for the scope of work to be completed by the consultant as outlined in the contract, of this date, in the amount of$54, 000.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.









RESOLUTION ADOPTED  -  SUBORDINATE A MORTGAGE OBTAINED THROUGH

CHIP

Mr. Neal moved the adoption of the following resolution:

RESOLUTION NO. 18- 110

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE ROSS COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS TO SUBORDINATE A

MORTGAGE OBTAINED THROUGH THE ROSS COUNTY COMMUNITY HOUSING IMPROVBEMENT PROGRAM

WHEREAS, the Ross County Board of Commissioners holds a mortgage to secure repayment of a Rehab loan through the FT10 Ross
County Community Housing Impact and Preservation Program from homeowner Bruce and Laura Hambrick; and

WHEREAS, the above homeowner obtained a mortgage through Quicken Loans in the amount of$ 89, 000 for refinancing the current
mortgage for the purpose of cash back to build an addition and to go from a variable rate to a fixed rate; and

WHEREAS, Ross County will remain in a second mortgage position with its mortgage of$ 32, 150. 00; now, therefore, be it

RESOLVED,  that the Board of Commissioners of Ross County,  Ohio,  is hereby authorized to sign mortgage Subordination
Agreement for the above homeowner.

Mr. Garrett seconded and the result of the roll call vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

Adopted this 20th of February, 2018.

Board of Commissioners of Ross County,
Ohio

R. Douglas Corcoran, President

Stephen A. Neal, Vice President

Dwight A. Garrett

END*****

SEALED QUOTES OPENED - VARIOUS ROAD MATERIALS

The commissioners opened sealed quotes as advertised, at 11: 30 a.m., for the furnishing of various road materials.  Quotations were

submitted by the following vendors:

1.  Valley Asphalt Corp. 4. Shelly Materials 7. Latham Limestone, LLC.      10.      Tow

Path

Cincinnati, OH Chillicothe, OH Latham, OH Beaver,

OH

2.   Olen Corp.      5. Tow Path 8. G & J Asphalt & Material

Columbus, OH Frankfort, OH Chillicothe, OH

3.   Melvin Stone Co., LLC 6. Hanson Excavating, Inc.       9. RossCo Redi Mix

Sabina, OH Chillicothe, OH Chillicothe, OH

PRICES IIN EFFECT 2-2748 TO 2- 11- 19.

AGGREGATE EB p....  ....S urnASPHALT CONCRETE " CONCRETE Aced CaHr.SXaam Calcium 9 Bag
41& 2 Ton 304 411 8 9       ' Rork Grits  ', 448 TYPE 1 448 TYPE 2, 5 112 Bag 6 IBag 6 112 Bag Hear Cht 1%    Cht, 2     Grout

HANSON IEXCAVATIING NO BIID NO BID NO BIID NO BID NO BID NO BIID   $  4,00 i

Minimum 200 Tans Delivered      NO BdD NO BID NO IBID NO IB-0D NO BID NO BIID590

LATHAM LIMESTONE__.... 10. 00  $   1 D 00 $    10 00 $    11 00 S 9 00 $   1400  $   9 00

0 4   _.  .. Minimum 200 Tors' Delivered y 17. 00 '$   17 00 $    17.00 $    18. 00 $   1500 $   24 00  $  18047

I

MIELVIN STONE-PLANO IRA.__.   ' ..  10. 50  $   1 0 50 S 10 5OJS IUD  $    9. 00 NO(BIID   $  0. 00

MifflMdru 200 Tons Delivered     $_ 14..50  $   1450 S 14. 50  $    17. 00  $   13. 00 NO BID   $  13.00

MIELVIN STONE-HOPIETOWNN NO BBD NO BIID NO IBID
i  

NO BID   $    5. 50 NO BBD   $   650

M.... rnu rr 200 Tana INOBID d NO BID NO IBfD NO BRD   $    9. 00 NO IBRD   $   9. 00

S

10 50  $    fl4 00 I S 9. 00 NO BID   $   9 00 f

14. 50 9    - 18. 0  $   13. 00 NO BID   $  13 00Minimum 200 Tans Delivered     $   14. 50  $   14 50 ._

50 1050

5 16. 50 S 16. 50.,1 INC) BID .. NO BID 3. 50..      11V400  $ 1

Minimum 200 Tans Deliiwererd-„__„---- ' S 18. 75  $   16. 755 S 18. 75  . S.   18. 75w„ w

NO BID NO BID   $. 7 00   _-.-_.       ----... ._  ..._.,.._..... __.. ................     ....._.   .-------- 

5. 00  $   125. 00TOW PATH MATERIALS NO BID NO BID 05 00 $   108.00 $ 5. 00 $    2. 50.   

rROSS OIR;EAOY MIX 1104. 00 $ 106: 00 $   1( 18- DO $ 3. aq $    300 16. 00     $ 0135.00

GLEN CORP GS HIGH S TYPED}      
m._ m_._  

50- 100 B ons Per Day 11. 00  $    10.100 S 10.,50 $    22. 50 $    8. 50 $   18.50!,$   6. 50 i..,_.._....__
Over 100 Tong Per Day 14. 80  $   1880 $   19. 30 $    31. 30 IS 17. 30 $   29.86 $  15. 30

G& J ASPHALT 65.50 $   80.60

50-100 Tans Per Day 65.50 $   60, 50

Over 100 Toms Per Day
mm

65.50  $   80.50

VALLEY ASPHALT 72. 00  $   70.00

50- 100 Tons Per Day 72. 00  $   70.00

Over 100 Tons Per Day 72. 00  $   70.00

The quotes were referred to the county engineer, Charlie Ortman for review.



END*****

TIME SHEETS APPROVED - COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR & CLERK

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve time sheets submitted by Bradford M.
Cosenza, county administrator and Gail L. Stout, clerk to the Board, for the pay period ending February 17, 2018.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

ADVERTISING AUTHORIZED PUBLIC HEARING SET   -   PY 2018 COMMUNITY

HOUSING IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM (CHIP)

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that publication be authorized in the Chillicothe Gazette, on February 23, 2018 & on the Ross

County Commissioner' s website  ( RC 307. 87)   at http://www.rosscountycommissioners. com.,   for the Community Housing
Improvement Program ( CHIP), for fiscal year 2018, and that said hearing be held in the Office of the Ross County Board of
Commissioners on March 12, 2018, at 10: 00 a.m., to provide citizens with pertinent information about the aforementioned program,

including an explanation of eligible activities, fair housing requirements and related infrastructure improvements.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

SEXUAL ASSAULT SURVIVOR ADVOCATES AUTHORIZED TO USE THE

COURTHOUSE STEPS FOR CEREMONY

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that Sexual Assault Survivor Advocates, be authorized to use the courthouse steps for a short

community event April 28, 2018, convening at 10: 00, in observance of Sexual Awareness Month.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

SUBJECTS BROUGHT BEFORE THE BOARD

Melody Young, executive director Ross- Chillicothe Convention & Visitors Bureau ( CVB), met with the commissioner to present their

annual report from 2017.  Nancy Ames, CVB Board member, was also in attendance.

Ms. Young state that since we have moved our office to its new location, we have seen over 700 visitors in 2017.  The move has made

it more accessible for visitors to Ross County.  This was the first full year of operation of the Fairfield Inn & Suites.  We have seen a

9% increase in lodging tax receipts when compared to 2016.  Numbers for area attractions also displayed an upward trend, with a 5%

overall increase in attraction attendance translating to 5, 608 additional visitors to the local area.  We will celebrate 35 years for the

Feast of the Flowing Moon.  Results of an economic impact study tied to what the local area can expect if World Heritage Site status is
bestowed upon the Hopewell Ceremonial Earthworks is being planned for March 6 at the PACCAR Medical Education Center on the
Adena Regional Medical Center campus.

Mr. Corcoran said that while the study' s conclusions were termed conservative and the figures a bit underwhelming, they still point to
a significant visitor impact to the area.

Ms. Young said that with zero promotion, us doing nothing in terms of marketing, as a community, they still think we will see 100%
increase over the first five years in visitors.  We do appreciate all the county commissioners' support in everything that we do.

ADJOURNMENT

Mr. R. Douglas Corcoran, President, adjourned the regular meeting of, February 20, 2018, at 4: 05 p.m.
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